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REPAIR OF BIOMEDICAL EQUIPMENTS UNDER BIOMEDICAL E

QUIPMENTMAINTENANCE
PROGRAM (BEMP)

Recommendations for Beyond Economic Repair (BER)

PROFORMA
\;‘ly\NameofDistrict - kOLLAM o
L‘Z Name of Hospital DH KOLLAM
Equipment : ELISA WASHER
Name of Equipment with Make, Model [Make: Biorad

3 | and Serial Number Model: PW-40
SN : EC2K480006

4 Equipment ID & Barcode Tleet |d 108269 / Barcode H 0210279
5 Date of p?urchase ! Year of manufacture 02-09-2013

/Installation Date
6 | Warranty details (Yes/No) No warranty

7 *AMC/ CAMC Period agreed at the time [No AMC/CMC
of purchase

8 Date of breakdown(Date of registration [26-04-2024
of complaint through email/ Toll free)

Regarding inspection of the equipment
9 | Action taken Display, CPU Mainboard, manifold,
\Vaccumpump, Valve, tubing's,
connectors are defective. Enquire d
spare with OEM ‘

10 Present status of the equipment (Fully
damaged / partially damaged) Fully damaged

Not recommending for repair.
Recommendations for repair

11 [ (required service details)

PW40 Manifold 8 can.circuit A = 19033.40
PW4x Vaccum Pump(1 unit)EMC = 26166.50
PWA40 carte afficheure LCD = 9805.80

12 | Cost of spares (specify parts and cost)  [PW40 CMS CPU Board = 38586

PWxx Pinch Valve = 6862

PW40 External Tubing set = 7239.30

PW40 Manifold Connector = 4130

Total = 1,11,823 /-




13 | Asset Val
o reme Rs. 156116/-

# percentage value of the cost of
spareswith respect to Cost of
Purchase/ Asset

Value

14 71.62%

Cyrix service report , Quotation &
ail communication attached

Abstract of Service Report provided by
15 | the OEM/ Authorized Service Provider/
CYRIX (Attached or Not)

isplay, CPU Mainboard, manifold
ircuit, Vaccumpump, Valve,
bing's, connectors are defective,
16 | Reasons for recommending the Equipment is inst?;ed on 0_,2-01;)'-‘(2”01'th 3

i nd up to years 7+ )
equipment as BER Repaiar?:; cogt of equipment is 71.62%.
As per tender clause 5.3.14.1, both
criteria met. so recommending (o
demnation.

17 | Name & Signature of CYRIX Authority  |RISHIN R

*Not mandatory #Based on the period of life and value as per the BER guidelines
* Attach Photograph

Remarks and Recommendations of Consultant (Biomedical) NHM:
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™M Gmail

Abilal 8 [ DY Mol ]

Re: PRICE ENQUIRY - ELISA WASHER - DH KOLLAM - 0210279

1 message

Abilal S [ DI Kollam_) <abllalcyrix@gmall.com>
’(fi"A.KENTERPRISES‘ <akenterprises kerala@gmail.com>
x@gmail.com>, Afsal ZM new mail <zm1.kdbemp@cyrix.in>

Reminder

Dear Sir,

Kindly share the Price and Stock availability of Spares needed for Elisa washer PW - 40.

On Sat, 15 Jun 2024 at 11:19, Abilal S [LDI Kollam_] <abilalcyrix@gmail.com> wrote:
Sir,

Please find the images
K7 ]
|

Manifold
On Sat, 15 Jun 2024 at 07:57, Abilal S [LDI Kollam_] <abilalcyrix@gmail.com> wrote:
Sir,

Please find the images

- abilabe yrivEigraal! c am>

19 Jure 2024 at 09 17

Purchase Cyrix <purchasecyrix2@gmail.com>, arjun u <arjunucyrix@gmail.com>, Abijith A DM Cyrix South
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On Mon, 10 Jun 2024 at 11:29, AK.ENTERPRISES <akenterprises.kerala@gmail.com> wrote:
Sir,

Please share the photos of the above mentioned spares.

Regards,

Brindha

On Sat, May 11, 2024 at 10:08 AM Abilal S [_DI Kollam_] <abilalcyrix@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Kindly share the Price and Stock availability of Spares needed for Elisa washer PW - 40.

Display,

Main Board,
Manifold,
Connectors,

Electro Valve,
Vacuum pump,
Tubing set

Hospital : DH KOLLAM
Make : BIORAD
Model : PW40
SINo:

Barcode. : 0210279

Thanks and Regards
ABILAL S
District incharge
CYRIX HEALTHCARE Pvt. Ltd
Kollam - 691002
Ph:+91 7593847161

* At your service for 28 Years in Diagnostics Business

Best Regards

A.K.ENTERPRISES
T.C. 9/ 1775, Patanikunnu Lane
y Sasthamangalam
Thiruvananthapuram - 695010
Phone : + 91 471 231 22 46 | Mobile : + 91 99958 23464
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privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies
and the original message. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure,dissemination, lorwarding, printing or copying of this
email or any action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. The reciplent acknowledges
that AK.ENTERPRISES Is unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantes the integrity of/over the contents of the
information contained in e-mail transmissions and further acknowledges that any views expressed in this message ars those
of the individual sender and no binding nature of the message shall be implied or assumed unless the sender does 50

:"?TBSSN with due authority of AK.ENTERPRISES. Before opening any attachments please check them for viruses and
efects.

Thanks and Regards
ABILAL S
District incharge
CYRIX HEALTHCARE Pvt. Ltd
Kollam - 691002
Ph:+91 7593847161

Thanks and Regards
ABILAL S
District incharge
CYRIX HEALTHCARE Pvt. Ltd
Kollam - 691002
Ph:+91 7593847161

Thanks and Regards
ABILAL .S
District incharge
CYRIX HEALTHCARE Pvt. Ltd
Kollam - 691002
Ph:+91 7593847161 0/
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M Gmail

?li?s:' ATION FOR THE SUPPLY OF BIO-RAD SPARES - PW 40
message

Abllal § [_DI Kollam ] <abilalcyrix@dgmail com>

?K;ENTERPRISES <akenterpn’ses.kerala@gman,com> 25 June 2024 at 1728
o: Abilal S [_DI !(ollam_]" <abilalcyrix@gmail.com>

Cc. Purchase Cyrix <purchasecyrix2@gmail.com>
<abijithacyrix@gmail.com>, Afsal ZM new mail <

Sir,

, arjun u <arjunucyrix@gmail.com>, Abijith A DM Cyrix South
zm1 kibemp@cyrix.in>, jaigovind_narayan <jaigovind_narayan@hbio-rad com>

Please find the attached quotation for the supply of PW 40 Spares from Bio-Rad.
Assuring our best possible services at all times, we remain.

Regards,
Brindha

" At your service for 28 Years in Diagnostics Business™

Best Regards

C.V.Ramanathan

Head - Business Operations

A .K.ENTERPRISES

T.C. 9/ 1775, Patanikunnu Lane

Sasthamangalam

Thiruvananthapuram - 695010

Phone : + 91 471 231 22 46 | Mobile : + 91 99958 23464

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies and
the original message. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure,dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this email or any
action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. The recipient acknowledges that
A.K.ENTERPRISES is unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantee the integrity of/over the contents of the information
contained in e-mail transmissions and further acknowledges that any views expressed in this message are those of the individual
sender and no binding nature of the message shall be implied or assumed unless the sender does so expressly with due authority
of A.K.ENTERPRISES. Before opening any attachments please check them for viruses and defects.
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TC. 9/1775, Patanikunnu Lane,
' Sasthamangalam, Thiruvananthapuram - 695 010.
®:0471-2312246 [0: 99958 23464 & akenterprises.kerala@gmail.com

& A.K. ENTERPRISES
P |

AK/KER/NEWBRISPARES /QT/24-25/003 25.06.2024
To

Cyrix HealthCare Pvt Ltd

Kollam
Sir,

Sub: Quotation for the supply of Spares - PW 40 Washer - Bio-Rad

Net Price in
S.No Description part No | Price in Rs |GST @ 18% Rs.

1 PW40 MANIFOLD 8 CAN.CIRCUIT A 87041 16,130.00| 2,903.40 19,033.40

2 PW4&X VACUUM PUMP(1 UNIT) EMC 87968 22,175.00| 3,991.50 26,166.50

3 PW40 CARTE AFFICHEURE LCD 87011 8,310.00| 1,495.80 9,805.80
4 PWA40 CMS CPU BOARD 89201 32,700.00| 5,886.00| 38,586.00

S PWXX PINCH VALVE 85235 5,900.00 1,062.00 6,9Gim

g PWA40 EXTERNAL TUBING SET 87972 6,135.00) 1,104.30 7,239.30
J PW40 MANIFOLD CONNECTOR 87045 3,500.00 630.00 4,130.00

Terms & Conditions: .

Taxes: GST @ 18 % Extra
Payment: 100% Advance Payment

Assuring our best possible services at all imes, we remain.

Bank Details - KARNATAKA BANK LTD. Triplicane Branch, A/c. No. 4887000100114701, IFSC : KARB0000488

Received by Drug Licence KL - TVM - 122051 (Form 20B) Make all Cheques Payable lo
KL- TVM- 122052 (Form 21B)

- oo b A.K. ENTERPRISES

STATE CODE 2
Questions concemeng this Invoce 7

Prhone 0471 - 2312246
Note - Subject 10 Thiruvananthapuram Jurnsdiction only
ure &
Signat Seal THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS! (Adthornsed Signatory)
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